

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**North Oxbow**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 1**

**Attendees:**

**Size:** 35 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Shamco		Wild Rivers		Franks	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	525	CDS	\$28.30	\$14,857.50	\$25.00	\$13,125.00	\$38.21	\$20,060.25	\$39.27	\$20,616.75
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	280	CDS	\$16.80	\$4,704.00	\$22.00	\$6,160.00	\$34.21	\$9,578.80	\$27.70	\$7,756.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	25	CDS	\$8.50	\$212.50	\$15.00	\$375.00	\$13.21	\$330.25	\$11.50	\$287.50
Oak Pulp	25	CDS	\$11.10	\$277.50	\$22.00	\$550.00	\$22.21	\$555.25	\$15.00	\$375.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>855</b>	<b>CDS</b>		<b>\$20,051.50</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$20,210.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$30,524.55</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$29,035.25</b>
					<b>10% =</b>	<b>\$2,021.00</b>	<b>10% =</b>	<b>\$3,052.46</b>	<b>10% =</b>	<b>\$2,903.53</b>

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	525	CDS	\$28.30	\$14,857.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	280	CDS	\$16.80	\$4,704.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	25	CDS	\$8.50	\$212.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Oak Pulp	25	CDS	\$11.10	\$277.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>855</b>	<b>CDS</b>		<b>\$20,051.50</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
					<b>10% =</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>10% =</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>10% =</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Pine River North**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 2**

**Attendees:**

**Size:** 43 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers		Shamco			
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	525	CDS	\$27.40	\$14,385.00	\$35.21	\$18,485.25	\$34.10	\$17,902.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	200	CDS	\$19.30	\$3,860.00	\$30.21	\$6,042.00	\$22.00	\$4,400.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	110	CDS	\$8.50	\$935.00	\$14.11	\$1,552.10	\$15.00	\$1,650.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Oak Pulp	6	CDS	\$12.70	\$76.20	\$22.21	\$133.26	\$22.00	\$132.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>841</b>	<b>CDS</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$19,256.20</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$26,212.61</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$24,084.50</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
					10% =	\$2,621.26	10% =	\$2,408.45	10% =	\$0.00

Error on Total

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	525	CDS	\$27.40	\$14,385.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	200	CDS	\$19.30	\$3,860.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	110	CDS	\$8.50	\$935.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Oak Pulp	6	CDS	\$12.70	\$76.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>841</b>	<b>CDS</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$19,256.20</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
					10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Conservation Pond**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 3**

**Attendees:**

**Size:** 73 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers		Shamco		Franks	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Oak Pulp	220	CDS	\$ 13.50	\$2,970.00	\$ 31.21	\$6,866.20	\$ 25.00	\$5,500.00	\$ 20.10	\$4,422.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	220	CDS	\$ 15.10	\$3,322.00	\$ 28.21	\$6,206.20	\$ 28.00	\$6,160.00	\$ 18.10	\$3,982.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	45	CDS	\$ 12.00	\$540.00	\$ 14.11	\$634.95	\$ 15.00	\$675.00	\$ 9.00	\$405.00
Aspen Pulp	25	CDS	\$ 24.50	\$612.50	\$ 28.21	\$705.25	\$ 30.00	\$750.00	\$ 20.50	\$512.50
Jack Pine Pulp	9	CDS	\$ 21.10	\$189.90	\$ 32.11	\$288.99	\$ 15.00	\$135.00	\$ 14.00	\$126.00
Oak Logs	55	MBF	\$ 135.00	\$7,425.00	\$ 140.00	\$7,700.00	\$ 225.00	\$12,375.00	\$ 125.00	\$6,875.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	1	MBF	\$ 126.00	\$126.00	\$ 160.00	\$160.00	\$ 175.00	\$175.00	\$ 125.00	\$125.00
Totals	519	CDS	Total	\$15,059.40	Total	\$22,561.59	Total	\$25,770.00	Total	\$16,447.50
	56	MBF			10%	\$2,256.16	10%	\$2,577.00	10%	\$1,644.75

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Oak Pulp	220	CDS	\$ 13.50	\$2,970.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	220	CDS	\$ 15.10	\$3,322.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	45	CDS	\$ 12.00	\$540.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	25	CDS	\$ 24.50	\$612.50	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Jack Pine Pulp	9	CDS	\$ 21.10	\$189.90	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Oak Logs	55	MBF	\$ 135.00	\$7,425.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	1	MBF	\$ 126.00	\$126.00	\$ 1.00	\$1.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	519	CDS	Total	\$15,059.40	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	56	MBF			10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Bait and Switch**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 4**

**Attendees:**

**Size:** 29 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkows  
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers		Shamco		Biewer	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Red Pine Pulp	1050	CDS	\$ 75.00	\$78,750.00	\$ 89.31	\$93,775.50	\$ 71.10	\$74,655.00	\$ 63.50	\$66,675.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	5	CDS	\$ 18.80	\$94.00	\$ 26.21	\$131.05	\$ 22.00	\$110.00	\$ 20.00	\$100.00
Jack Pine Pulp	10	CDS	\$ 35.00	\$350.00	\$ 36.21	\$362.10	\$ 15.00	\$150.00	\$ 63.50	\$635.00
Totals	1065	CDS	Total	\$79,194.00	Total	\$94,268.65	Total	\$74,915.00	Total	\$67,410.00
					10%	\$9,426.87	10%	\$7,491.50	10%	\$6,741.00

			MINIMUM BID		Pomeroy		Bell Timber			
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Red Pine Pulp	1050	CDS	\$ 75.00	\$78,750.00	\$ 72.73	\$76,366.50	\$ 101.81	\$106,900.50	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	5	CDS	\$ 18.80	\$94.00	\$ 5.00	\$25.00	\$ 18.00	\$90.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Jack Pine Pulp	10	CDS	\$ 35.00	\$350.00	\$ 20.00	\$200.00	\$ 18.00	\$180.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	1065	CDS	Total	\$79,194.00	Total	\$76,591.50	Total	\$107,170.50	Total	\$0.00
					10%	\$7,659.15	10%	\$10,717.05	10%	\$0.00

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Burma Aspen**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 5**

**Attendees:**

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

**Size:** 39 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers		Shamco		Franks	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	480	CDS	\$ 27.70	\$13,296.00	\$ 35.21	\$16,900.80	\$ 31.10	\$14,928.00	\$ 33.10	\$15,888.00
Oak Pulp	85	CDS	\$ 14.20	\$1,207.00	\$ 24.61	\$2,091.85	\$ 22.00	\$1,870.00	\$ 33.10	\$2,813.50
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	60	CDS	\$ 15.10	\$906.00	\$ 28.21	\$1,692.60	\$ 22.00	\$1,320.00	\$ 28.00	\$1,680.00
Jack Pine Pulp	19	CDS	\$ 19.80	\$376.20	\$ 36.21	\$687.99	\$ 15.00	\$285.00	\$ 15.00	\$285.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	7	CDS	\$ 12.00	\$84.00	\$ 13.11	\$91.77	\$ 15.00	\$105.00	\$ 10.00	\$70.00
Totals	651	CDS	Total	\$15,869.20	Total	\$21,465.01	Total	\$18,508.00	Total	\$20,736.50
					10%	\$2,146.50	10%	\$1,850.80	10%	\$2,073.65

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	480	CDS	\$ 27.70	\$13,296.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Oak Pulp	85	CDS	\$ 14.20	\$1,207.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	60	CDS	\$ 15.10	\$906.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Jack Pine Pulp	19	CDS	\$ 19.80	\$376.20	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	7	CDS	\$ 12.00	\$84.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Totals	651	CDS	Total	\$15,869.20	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
					10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**JT**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 6**

**Attendees:**

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

**Size:** 30 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

			MINIMUM BID		Franks		Shamco			
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	290	CDS	\$ 27.40	\$7,946.00	\$ 38.80	\$11,252.00	\$ 35.10	\$10,179.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	140	CDS	\$ 15.40	\$2,156.00	\$ 30.05	\$4,207.00	\$ 22.00	\$3,080.00		\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	65	CDS	\$ 8.00	\$520.00	\$ 15.00	\$975.00	\$ 15.00	\$975.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	2	MBF	\$ 120.00	\$240.00	\$ 180.00	\$360.00	\$ 175.00	\$350.00		\$0.00
Totals	495	CDS	Total	\$10,862.00	Total	\$16,794.00	Total	\$14,584.00	Total	\$0.00
	2	MBF			10%	\$1,679.40	10%	\$1,458.40	10%	\$0.00

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	290	CDS	\$ 27.40	\$7,946.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	140	CDS	\$ 15.40	\$2,156.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	65	CDS	\$ 8.00	\$520.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	2	MBF	\$ 120.00	\$240.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Totals	495	CDS	Total	\$10,862.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	2	MBF			10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Spur**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 7**

**Attendees:**

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

**Size:** 54 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers					
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	500	CDS	\$ 28.00	\$14,000.00	\$ 42.71	\$21,355.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Oak Pulp	210	CDS	\$ 14.40	\$3,024.00	\$ 28.21	\$5,924.10		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	100	CDS	\$ 17.20	\$1,720.00	\$ 32.21	\$3,221.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Red Pine Pulp	70	CDS	\$ 38.20	\$2,674.00	\$ 64.21	\$4,494.70		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	5	CDS	\$ 12.00	\$60.00	\$ 13.11	\$65.55		\$0.00		\$0.00
Totals	885	CDS	Total	\$21,478.00	Total	\$35,060.35	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
					10%	\$3,506.04	10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	500	CDS	\$ 28.00	\$14,000.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Oak Pulp	210	CDS	\$ 14.40	\$3,024.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	100	CDS	\$ 17.20	\$1,720.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Red Pine Pulp	70	CDS	\$ 38.20	\$2,674.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	5	CDS	\$ 12.00	\$60.00	\$ -	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Totals	885	CDS	Total	\$21,478.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
					10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00

**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Shin Dig Aspen**

**Lump Sum**

**Advertised # 8**

**Attendees:**

**NO BID**

**Size:** 41 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	825	CDS	\$26.00	\$21,450.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	120	CDS	\$18.60	\$2,232.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pu	25	CDS	\$13.00	\$325.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>970</b>	<b>CDS</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$24,007.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
					10% =	\$0.00	10% =	\$0.00	10% =	\$0.00

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	825	CDS	\$26.00	\$21,450.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	120	CDS	\$18.60	\$2,232.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pu	25	CDS	\$13.00	\$325.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>970</b>	<b>CDS</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$24,007.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>Total</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
					10% =	\$0.00	10% =	\$0.00	10% =	\$0.00



**Spring 2024 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest**

\* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

**Quartz Creek**

**Scale Sale**

**Advertised # 9**

**Attendees:**

**NO BID**

**Size:** 73 acres  
**Contract Length:** 3 year

**Time & Date of Opening:** 9:00AM 5/8/2024  
**Location:** Florence Resource Center  
5617 Forestry Drive  
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar  
Tyler Wood  
Taylor Ziolkowski  
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	450	CDS	\$ 12.80	\$5,760.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	300	CDS	\$ 10.20	\$3,060.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	270	CDS	\$ 17.90	\$4,833.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	10	CDS	\$ 7.70	\$77.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	35	MBF	\$ 102.00	\$3,570.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Basswood Logs	3	MBF	\$ 92.00	\$276.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	1030	CDS	Total	\$17,576.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	38	MBF			10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	450	CDS	\$ 12.80	\$5,760.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	300	CDS	\$ 10.20	\$3,060.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	270	CDS	\$ 17.90	\$4,833.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	10	CDS	\$ 7.70	\$77.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	35	MBF	\$ 102.00	\$3,570.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Basswood Logs	3	MBF	\$ 92.00	\$276.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	1030	CDS	Total	\$17,576.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	38	MBF			10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00

**2024 SPRING TIMBER SALES - FLORENCE COUNTY**

<b>Sale #</b>	<b>Sale Name</b>	<b>Contractor</b>	<b>Minimum Bid</b>	<b>High Bid</b>
1	North Oxbow	Wild Rivers	\$ 20,051.50	\$ 30,524.55
2	Pine River North	Wild Rivers	\$ 19,256.20	\$ 26,212.61
3	Conservation Pond	Shamco	\$ 15,059.40	\$ 25,770.00
4	Bait and Switch	Bell Timber	\$ 79,194.00	\$ 107,170.50
5	Burma Aspen	Wild Rivers	\$ 10,862.00	\$ 21,465.01
6	JT	Franks	\$ 10,862.00	\$ 16,794.00
7	Spur	Wild Rivers	\$ 21,478.00	\$ 35,060.35
8	Shin Dig Aspen	NO BID		
9	Quartz Creek	NO BID		
	Total		\$ 176,763.10	\$ 262,997.02