

Spring 2022 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Leave it to Oak

Scale Sale

Advertised # 1

Attendees:

Size: 125 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 5/11/2022
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Minerick Logging		Northwest Hdws		Wild Rivers Forestry Inc	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Red Oak Pulp	1450	CDS	\$12.20	\$17,690.00	\$35.00	\$50,750.00	\$18.00	\$26,100.00	\$28.11	\$40,759.50
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	180	CDS	\$17.00	\$3,060.00	\$35.00	\$6,300.00	\$20.00	\$3,600.00	\$32.21	\$5,797.80
Aspen	60	CDS	\$26.80	\$1,608.00	\$40.00	\$2,400.00	\$15.00	\$900.00	\$34.21	\$2,052.60
Red Oak Logs	400	MBF	\$153.00	\$61,200.00	\$361.72	\$144,688.00	\$300.00	\$120,000.00	\$240.00	\$96,000.00
TOTAL	1690	CDS		\$83,558.00	Total	\$204,138.00	Total	\$150,600.00	Total	\$144,609.90
	400	MBF			10% =	\$20,413.80	10% =	\$15,060.00	10% =	\$14,460.99

			Franks Logging							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Red Oak Pulp	1450	CDS	\$36.10	\$52,345.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	180	CDS	\$36.10	\$6,498.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Aspen	60	CDS	\$40.10	\$2,406.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Red Oak Logs	400	MBF	\$300.00	\$120,000.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
TOTAL	1690	CDS		\$181,249.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	400	MBF	10% =	\$18,124.90	10% =	\$0.00	10% =	\$0.00	10% =	\$0.00

Spring 2022 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Rex Aspen

Lump Sum

Advertised # 2

Attendees:

Size: 55 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 5/11/2022
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Shamco		Pyrz Logging		Minerick Logging	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	1150	CDS	\$23.80	\$27,370.00	\$48.25	\$55,487.50	\$19.00	\$21,850.00	\$46.92	\$53,958.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	205	CDS	\$15.90	\$3,259.50	\$22.75	\$4,663.75	\$19.00	\$3,895.00	\$46.92	\$9,618.60
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	21	CDS	\$8.90	\$186.90	\$40.00	\$840.00	\$19.00	\$399.00	\$46.92	\$985.32
TOTAL	1376	CDS	Total	\$30,816.40	Total	\$60,991.25	Total	\$26,144.00	Total	\$64,561.92
					10% = \$	6,099.13	10% = \$	2,614.40	10% = \$	6,456.19

			Wild Rivers		Gorzinski					
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	1150	CDS	\$47.41	\$54,521.50	\$25.00	\$28,750.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	205	CDS	\$34.21	\$7,013.05	\$25.00	\$5,125.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	21	CDS	\$14.11	\$296.31	\$22.00	\$462.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
TOTAL	1376	CDS	Total	\$61,830.86	Total	\$34,337.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
				10% = \$	6,183.09	10% =	10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-

No Bid Check

Spring 2022 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Jutra Aspen

Lump Sum

Advertised # 3

Attendees:

Size: 56 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 5/11/2022
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Shamco		Pyrz Logging		Jauquet	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	725	CDS	\$ 26.80	\$19,430.00	\$ 43.10	\$31,247.50	\$ 22.00	\$15,950.00	\$ 33.33	\$24,164.25
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	180	CDS	\$ 15.70	\$2,826.00	\$ 21.50	\$3,870.00	\$ 22.00	\$3,960.00	\$ 17.33	\$3,119.40
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	85	CDS	\$ 8.20	\$697.00	\$ 25.10	\$2,133.50	\$ 12.00	\$1,020.00	\$ 7.33	\$623.05
Totals	990	CDS	Total	\$22,953.00	Total	\$37,251.00	Total	\$20,930.00	Total	\$27,906.70
		MBF			10%	\$9,312.75	10%	\$5,232.50	10%	\$6,976.68

			Gorzinski Forest Products		Franks Logging					
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	725	CDS	\$ 25.00	\$18,125.00	\$ 43.50	\$31,537.50		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	180	CDS	\$ 25.00	\$4,500.00	\$ 32.50	\$5,850.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	85	CDS	\$ 22.00	\$1,870.00	\$ 20.50	\$1,742.50		\$0.00		\$0.00
Totals	990	CDS	Total	\$24,495.00	Total	\$39,130.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
		MBF			10%	\$3,913.00	10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00

No Bid Check

Spring 2022 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Ellis Aspen

Lump Sum

Advertised # 4

Attendees:

Size: 83 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 5/11/2022
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkows
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Shamco		Pyrzcz Logging		Minerick Logging	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	675	CDS	\$ 22.30	\$15,052.50	\$ 40.75	\$27,506.25	\$ 22.00	\$14,850.00	\$ 41.61	\$28,086.75
Scrub Oak Pulp	350	CDS	\$ 10.70	\$3,745.00	\$ 15.75	\$5,512.50	\$ 7.00	\$2,450.00	\$ 41.61	\$14,563.50
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	340	CDS	\$ 15.90	\$5,406.00	\$ 21.00	\$7,140.00	\$ 22.00	\$7,480.00	\$ 41.61	\$14,147.40
Jack Pine	50	CDS	\$ 22.30	\$1,115.00	\$ 25.00	\$1,250.00	\$ 20.00	\$1,000.00	\$ 41.61	\$2,080.50
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	7	CDS	\$ 9.60	\$67.20	\$ 40.75	\$285.25	\$ 8.00	\$56.00	\$ 41.61	\$291.27
Totals	1422	CDS	Total	\$25,385.70	Total	\$41,694.00	Total	\$25,836.00	Total	\$59,169.42
			10%=		10%=	\$4,169.40	10%=	\$2,583.60	10%=	\$5,916.94

			Pomeroy		Wild Rivers Forestry		Gorzinski			
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	675	CDS	\$ 33.21	\$22,416.75	\$ 39.21	\$26,466.75	\$ 20.00	\$13,500.00		\$0.00
Scrub Oak Pulp	350	CDS	\$ 27.21	\$9,523.50	\$ 26.21	\$9,173.50	\$ 20.00	\$7,000.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	340	CDS	\$ 24.55	\$8,347.00	\$ 32.21	\$10,951.40	\$ 22.00	\$7,480.00		\$0.00
Jack Pine	50	CDS	\$ 31.00	\$1,550.00	\$ 38.21	\$1,910.50	\$ 18.00	\$900.00		\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	7	CDS	\$ 31.00	\$217.00	\$ 14.21	\$99.47	\$ 18.00	\$126.00		\$0.00
Totals	1422	CDS	Total	\$42,054.25	Total	\$48,601.62	Total	\$29,006.00	Total	\$0.00
			10%=	\$4,205.43	10%=	\$4,860.16	10%=		10%=	\$0.00

No Bid Check

Spring 2022 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Camp 12

Scale Sale

Advertised # 5

Attendees:

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

Size: 55 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 5/11/2022
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

			MINIMUM BID		Gorzinski Forest Products					
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 17.90	\$358.00	\$ 20.00	\$400.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hdwd Pulp	130	CDS	\$ 12.80	\$1,664.00	\$ 22.00	\$2,860.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Spruce/Fir Pulp	40	CDS	\$ 7.70	\$308.00	\$ 18.00	\$720.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Black Spruce Pulp	230	CDS	\$ 15.30	\$3,519.00	\$ 18.00	\$4,140.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Cedar Pulp	550	CDS	\$ 5.10	\$2,805.00	\$ 30.00	\$16,500.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Black Ash Pulp	75	CDS	\$ 12.80	\$960.00	\$ 18.00	\$1,350.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	140	CDS	\$ 7.70	\$1,078.00	\$ 18.00	\$2,520.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Mixed Hdwd Logs	1	MBF	\$ 99.00	\$99.00	\$ 125.00	\$125.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
Totals	1185	CDS	Total	\$10,791.00	Total	\$28,615.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
					10%		10%	\$0.00	10%	\$0.00
					No Bid Check					

Spring 2022 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

JC Penny

Scale Sale

Advertised # 6

Attendees:

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

Size: 47 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 5/11/2022
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

			MINIMUM BID		Gorzinski Forest Products		Biewer		Franks Logging	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Red Pine Pulp	380	CDS	\$ 30.60	\$11,628.00	\$ 22.00	\$8,360.00	\$ 44.65	\$16,967.00	\$ 52.10	\$19,798.00
Aspen Pulp	210	CDS	\$ 23.80	\$4,998.00	\$ 22.00	\$4,620.00	\$ 32.20	\$6,762.00	\$ 32.10	\$6,741.00
Jack Pine Pulp	30	CDS	\$ 23.80	\$714.00	\$ 22.00	\$660.00	\$ 44.65	\$1,339.50	\$ 32.10	\$963.00
Oak Pulp	30	CDS	\$ 12.20	\$366.00	\$ 22.00	\$660.00	\$ 23.00	\$690.00	\$ 32.10	\$963.00
Mixed Hdwd Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 18.30	\$366.00	\$ 22.00	\$440.00	\$ 23.00	\$460.00	\$ 35.10	\$702.00
Fir Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 11.00	\$220.00	\$ 22.00	\$440.00	\$ 16.10	\$322.00	\$ 24.10	\$482.00
Totals	690	CDS	Total	\$18,292.00	Total	\$15,180.00	Total	\$26,540.50	Total	\$29,649.00
					10%		10%	\$6,635.13	10%	\$2,964.90

**Error on A Total
No Bid Check**

2022 SPRING TIMBER SALES - FLORENCE COUNTY

Sale #	Sale Name	Contractor	Minimum Bid	High Bid
1	Leave it to Oak	Minerick Logging	\$ 83,558.00	\$ 204,138.00
2	Rex Aspen	Minerick Logging	\$ 30,816.40	\$ 64,561.92
3	Jutra Aspen	Franks Logging	\$ 22,953.00	\$ 39,130.00
4	Ellis Aspen	Minerick Logging	\$ 25,385.70	\$ 59,169.42
5	Camp 12	Gorzinski Logging- check on bid check	\$ 10,791.00	\$ 28,615.00
6	JC Penny	Franks Logging	\$ 18,292.00	\$ 29,649.00
	Total		\$ 191,796.10	\$ 425,263.34