SPRING 2019 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest
* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Back to Scat Scale Sale Advertised # 1 Attendees:
Pat Smith
Mary Podnar
Size: 130 acres Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 6/12/2019 Andy Nault
Contract Length: 2 year Location: Florence Resource Center Tyler Wood
5617 Forestry Drive Henry Sullivan
Florence, WI 54121
MINIMUM BID Jacobson Logging
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Bid Value Bid Value
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 680 CDS $25.50 $17,340.00 $38.00 $25,840.00 $0.00 $0.00
Aspen Pulp 470 CDS $29.80 $14,006.00 $40.00 $18,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basswood Pulp 230 CDS $17.00 $3,910.00 $28.00 $6,440.00 $0.00 $0.00
Fir Pulp 25 CDS $17.00 $425.00 $28.00 $700.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oak Pulp 25 CDS $25.50 $637.50 $30.00 $750.00 $0.00 $0.00
Spruce Pulp 25 $25.50 $637.50 $30.00 $750.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basswood Logs 200 MBF | $170.00 $34,000.00 | $180.00 | $36,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Mixed Hdwd Logs 20 MBF | $213.00 $4,260.00 $200.00 $4,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oak Logs 6 MBF [ $255.00 $1,530.00 $200.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL 1380 CDS $76,746.00 Total $94,480.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00
31 MBF 10% = $9,448.00 10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00
NO BID CHECK

Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Bid Value Bid Value
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 680 CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Aspen Pulp 470 CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basswood Pulp 230 CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Fir Pulp 25 CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oak Pulp 25 CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Spruce Pulp 25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basswood Logs 200 MBF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Mixed Hdwd Logs 20 MBF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oak Logs 6 MBF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL 1455 CDS $0.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00
226 MBF 10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00




SPRING 2019 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Lake Edith 2 Scale Sale Advertised # 2 Attendees:
Pat Smith
Mary Podnar
Size: 63 Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM  6/12/2019 Andy Nault
Contract Length: 2 year Location: Florence Resource Center Tyler Wood
5617 Forestry Drive Henry Sullivan
Florence, WI 54121
MINIMUM BID

Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Bid Value
ASPEN PULP 340 | CDS $19.90 $6,766.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SPRUCE PULP 270 | CDS $25.50 $6,885.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MIXED HDWD PULP| 260 [ CDS $16.60 $4,316.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
FIR PULP 200 | CDS $11.40 $2,280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TAMARACK PULP 100 | CDS $11.40 $1,140.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MIXED HDWD LOGY 19 MBF $145.00 $2,755.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL 629 | CDS Total $24,142.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00

10%= $ - 10%= $ - 10%= $ -

Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Bid Value
ASPEN PULP 340 | CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SPRUCE PULP 270 | CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MIXED HDWD PULP| 260 | CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
FIR PULP 200 | CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TAMARACK PULP 100 | CDS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
MIXED HDWD LOGY 19 MBF $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL 629 | CDS Total $0.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00

10% = $ - 10% = $ - 10% = $ 10% = $ -




SPRING 2019 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Fire Lane Pine Scale Sale Advertised # 3 Attendees:
Pat Smith
Mary Podnar
Size: 26 Acres Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 6/12/2019 Andy Nault
Contract Length: 2 year Location: Florence Resource Center Tyler Wood
5617 Forestry Drive Henry Sullivan
Florence, Wl 54121
MINIMUM BID Wild Rivers Forestry Shamco Pomeroy
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Value
Red Pine Pulp 1140 CDS 59.50 $67,830.00 89.37 | $101,881.80 | § 78.08 | $89,011.20 | § 87.91 | $100,217.40
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 40 CDS 40.50 $1,620.00 34.21 | $1,368.40 | § 30.01 $1,200.40 | § 31.00 | $1,240.00
Aspen Pulp 20 CDS 47.30 $946.00 28.31 $566.20 b 35.01 $700.20 b 31.00 $620.00
Oak Pulp 15 CDS 31.40 $471.00 24.21 $363.15 b 25.01 $375.15 b 31.00 $465.00
Totals 1215 CDs Total $70,867.00 Total $104,179.55 Total $91,286.95 Total $102,542.40
10% = $10,417.96 10% = $9,128.70 10% =  $10,254.24
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Value
Red Pine Pulp 1140 CDS $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 40 CDS $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00
Aspen Pulp 20 CDS $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00
Oak Pulp 15 CDS $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00
Totals 1215 CDs Total $0.00 Total $0.00 Total 0.00 Total $0.00
10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00 10% = $0.00




SPRING 2019 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest
* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

101& D Scale Sale Advertised # 4 Attendees:
Pat Smith
Mary Podnar
Size: 104 acres Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM  6/12/2019 Andy Nault
Contract Length: 2 year Location: Florence Resource Center Tyler Wood
5617 Forestry Drive Henry Sullivan
Florence, WI 54121
MINIMUM BID Minerick Wild Rivers Forestry Franks
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Value
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 775 CDS| $ 2550 | $19,762.50 [$ 3350 | $25962.50 [ $ 30.31 | $23,490.25 | $ 33.30 | $25,807.50
Aspen Pulp 480 CDS| $ 29.80| $14,304.00 [$ 35.00| $16,800.00 [ $ 3531 | $16,948.80 | $ 40.30 | $19,344.00
Red Pine Pulp 200 CDS| $ 34.00 $6,800.00 $ 6550 | $13,100.00 | $ 8531 | $17,062.00 | $ 70.30 [ $14,060.00
Fir Pulp 145 CDS| $ 17.00 $2,465.00 $ 25.00 $3,625.00 $ 2231 $3,234.95 $ 19.00 $2,755.00
Spruce Pulp 35 CDS| $ 25.50 $892.50 $ 28.00 $980.00 $ 2231 $780.85 $ 21.00 $735.00
Oak Pulp 20 CDS| $ 25.50 $510.00 $ 25.00 $500.00 $ 2231 $446.20 $ 33.30 $666.00
Mixed Hdwd Logs 25 MBF | $ 213.00 $5,325.00 $ 200.00 $5,000.00 $ 130.00 $3,250.00 $ 190.00 $4,750.00
Oak Logs 5 MBF [ $ 255.00 $1,275.00 $ 250.00 $1,250.00 $ 150.00 $750.00 $ 190.00 $950.00
Totals 1655 CDS Total $51,334.00 Total $67,217.50 Total $65,963.05 Total $69,067.50
30 MBF 10%=  $6,721.75 10%=  $6,596.31 10%=  $6,906.75
Jacobson Logging Shamco
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Value
Mixed Hdwd Pulp 775 CDS| $ 36.00 | $27,900.00 | $ 33.25| $25,768.75 $0.00 $0.00
Aspen Pulp 480 CDS| $ 40.00 | $19,200.00 [ $ 42.15| $20,232.00 $0.00 $0.00
Red Pine Pulp 200 CDS| $ 50.00 | $10,000.00 [ $ 61.00 | $12,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
Fir Pulp 145 CDS| $ 26.00 $3,770.00 $ 20.15 $2,921.75 $0.00 $0.00
Spruce Pulp 35 CDS| $ 30.00 $1,050.00 $ 33.10 $1,158.50 $0.00 $0.00
Oak Pulp 20 CDS| $ 30.00 $600.00 $ 25.10 $502.00 $0.00 $0.00
Mixed Hdwd Logs 25 MBF | $ 200.00 $5,000.00 $ 275.00 $6,875.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oak Logs 5 MBF | $ 200.00 $1,000.00 $ 125.00 $625.00 $0.00 $0.00
Totals 1655 CDS Total $68,520.00 Total $70,283.00 Total $0.00 Total $0.00
30 MBF 10%=  $6,852.00 10%=  $7,028.30 10%= $0.00 10%= $0.00

NO BID CHECK




SPRING 2019 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

LITTLE MAN # 2 Scale Sale Advertised # 5 Attendees:
Pat Smith
Mary Podnar
Size: 110 acres Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 6/12/2019 Andy Nault
Contract Length: 2 year Location: Florence Resource Center Tyler Wood
5617 Forestry Drive Henry Sullivan
Florence, WI 54121
MINIMUM BID Minerick Wild Rivers Forestry Jacobson Logging
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Value
ASPEN PULP 1715 CDS $ 2980 | $51,107.00 | $ 53.58 | $91,889.70 | $ 43.21 | $74,105.15 | $ 39.10 | $67,056.50
MIXED HDWD PULP 560 CDS $ 2550 | $14,280.00 | $ 38.00 | $21,280.00 | $ 38.11 | $21,341.60 | $ 32.50 | $18,200.00
OAK PULP 110 CDS $ 25.50 $2,805.00 $ 3200 | $3520.00 | $ 3411 $3,752.10 | $ 28.00 | $3,080.00
FIR PULP 65 CDS $ 17.00 $1,105.00 $ 25.00 | $1,625.00 | $ 2611 $1,697.15 | $ 32.00 | $2,080.00
SPRUCE PULP 25 CDS $ 25.50 $637.50 $ 38.00 $950.00 $ 26.11 $652.75 $ 30.00 $750.00
RED OAK LOGS 35 MBF $ 255.00 $8,925.00 $275.00 | $9,625.00 | $ 210.00 [ $7,350.00 | $ 200.00 | $7,000.00
MIXED HDWD LOGS  17.5 MBF $ 213.00 $3,727.50 $190.00 | $3,325.00 | $ 210.00 [ $3,675.00 | $ 200.00 | $3,500.00
Totals 2475 CDS Total $82,587.00 Total $132,214.70 Total $112,573.75 Total $101,666.50
52.5 MBF 10%= $13,221.47 10%= $11,257.38 10%= $10,166.65
NO BID CHECK
Franks Shamco
Products Volume Bid Value Bid Value Value Value
ASPEN PULP 1715 CDS $ 4110 | $70,486.50 | $ 43.60 | $74,774.00 $0.00 $0.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 560 CDS $ 35.00| $19,600.00 |[$ 30.15| $16,884.00 $0.00 $0.00
OAK PULP 110 CDS $ 36.00 $3,960.00 $ 20.15 | $2,216.50 $0.00 $0.00
FIR PULP 65 CDS $ 20.00 $1,300.00 $ 20.15| $1,309.75 $0.00 $0.00
SPRUCE PULP 25 CDS $ 25.00 $625.00 $ 35.10 $877.50 $0.00 $0.00
RED OAK LOGS 35 MBF $ 200.00 $7,000.00 $125.00 | $4,375.00 $0.00 $0.00
MIXED HDWD LOGS  17.5 MBF $ 180.00 $3,150.00 $275.00 | $4,812.50 $0.00 $0.00
Totals 2475 CDS Total $106,121.50 Total $105,249.25 Total $0.00 Total $0.00
52.5 MBF 10%=  $10,612.15 10%= $10,524.93 10%= $0.00 10%= $0.00



2019 SPRING TIMBER SALES - FLORENCE COUNTY

Sale # Sale Name Contractor
1 Back to Scat Jacobson
2  Lake Edith 2 NO BID
3 Fire Lane Pine Wild Rivers Forestry
4 101 &D Shamco
5 Little Man 2 Minerick
Total

©O P e B

Minimum Bid
76,746.00
24,142.00
70,867.00
51,334.00
82,587.00

305,676.00

@B P BB &

High Bid
94,480.00

104,179.55

70,283.00
132,214.70
401,157.25



