

Fall 2023 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Optimus Pine

Scale Sale

Advertised # 1

Attendees:

Size: 47 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 10/10/2023
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Pomeroy		Biewer		Wild Rivers Forestry	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Red Pine Pulp	1150	CDS	\$51.00	\$58,650.00	\$83.75	\$96,312.50	\$90.00	\$103,500.00	\$93.21	\$107,191.50
Aspen Pulp	100	CDS	\$29.80	\$2,980.00	\$5.00	\$500.00	\$30.00	\$3,000.00	\$34.11	\$3,411.00
Tamarack Pulp	90	CDS	\$12.80	\$1,152.00	\$5.00	\$450.00	\$19.00	\$1,710.00	\$16.11	\$1,449.90
Fir/Spruce Pulp	55	CDS	\$17.00	\$935.00	\$5.00	\$275.00	\$19.00	\$1,045.00	\$12.11	\$666.05
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	40	CDS	\$21.30	\$852.00	\$5.00	\$200.00	\$20.00	\$800.00	\$31.11	\$1,244.40
White Pine Pulp	25	CDS	\$17.00	\$425.00	\$5.00	\$125.00	\$19.00	\$475.00	\$38.11	\$952.75
TOTAL	1460	CDS		\$64,994.00	Total	\$97,862.50	Total	\$110,530.00	Total	\$114,915.60
	0	MBF			10%=	\$9,786.25	10%=	\$11,053.00	10%=	\$11,491.56

			MINIMUM BID		Bell Timber		Shamco			
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value	Bid	Value
Red Pine Pulp	1150	CDS	\$51.00	\$58,650.00	\$104.55	\$120,232.50	\$50.40	\$57,960.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	100	CDS	\$29.80	\$2,980.00	\$31.00	\$3,100.00	\$30.10	\$3,010.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	90	CDS	\$12.80	\$1,152.00	\$12.00	\$1,080.00	\$15.00	\$1,350.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Fir/Spruce Pulp	55	CDS	\$17.00	\$935.00	\$25.00	\$1,375.00	\$15.00	\$825.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	40	CDS	\$21.30	\$852.00	\$31.00	\$1,240.00	\$18.80	\$752.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
White Pine Pulp	25	CDS	\$17.00	\$425.00	\$25.00	\$625.00	\$15.00	\$375.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL	1460	CDS		\$64,994.00	Total	\$127,652.50	Total	\$64,272.00	Total	\$0.00
	0	MBF			10%=	12765.25	10%=	6427.2	10%=	0

Fall 2023 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

NO BID

Shin Dig Aspen

Lump Sum

Advertised # 2

Attendees:

Size: 41 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 10/10/2023
Location: Florence Resource Center
 5617 Forestry Drive
 Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
 Tyler Wood
 Taylor Ziolkowski
 Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	825	CDS	\$29.80	\$24,585.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	120	CDS	\$21.30	\$2,556.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	25	CDS	\$17.00	\$425.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL	970	CDS	Total	\$27,566.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	0	MBF			10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value	Bid	Value
Aspen Pulp	825	CDS	\$29.80	\$24,585.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	120	CDS	\$21.30	\$2,556.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	25	CDS	\$17.00	\$425.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
TOTAL	970	CDS	Total	\$27,566.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	0	MBF			10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-	10% = \$	-

Fall 2023 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Big Block

Lump Sum

Advertised # 3

Attendees:

Size: 54 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 10/10/2023
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers Forestry		Pyrch		Minerick	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	750	CDS	\$ 29.80	\$22,350.00	\$ 32.21	\$24,157.50	\$ 26.00	\$19,500.00	\$ 28.00	\$21,000.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	100	CDS	\$ 21.30	\$2,130.00	\$ 32.11	\$3,211.00	\$ 30.00	\$3,000.00	\$ 18.00	\$1,800.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 17.00	\$340.00	\$ 12.11	\$242.20	\$ 10.00	\$200.00	\$ 10.00	\$200.00
Totals	870	CDS	Total	\$24,820.00	Total	\$27,610.70	Total	\$22,700.00	Total	\$23,000.00
	0	MBF			10%=	\$2,761.07	10%=	\$2,270.00	10%=	\$2,300.00

			MINIMUM BID							
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Aspen Pulp	750	CDS	\$ 29.80	\$22,350.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	100	CDS	\$ 21.30	\$2,130.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Balsam Fir/Spruce Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 17.00	\$340.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	870	CDS	Total	\$24,820.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	0	MBF			10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00

Fall 2023 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Red Tide

Scale Sale

Advertised # 4

Attendees:

Size: 68 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 10/10/2023
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers Forestry		Shamco		Albrecht Trucking II	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Oak Pulp	400	CDS	\$ 15.30	\$6,120.00	\$ 32.11	\$12,844.00	\$ 17.80	\$7,120.00	\$ 21.00	\$8,400.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	55	CDS	\$ 21.30	\$1,171.50	\$ 32.11	\$1,766.05	\$ 17.80	\$979.00	\$ 25.00	\$1,375.00
Aspen Pulp	60	CDS	\$ 29.80	\$1,788.00	\$ 36.11	\$2,166.60	\$ 28.50	\$1,710.00	\$ 15.00	\$900.00
Fir/Spruce Pulp	2	CDS	\$ 17.00	\$34.00	\$ 12.11	\$24.22	\$ 15.00	\$30.00	\$ 15.00	\$30.00
Oak Logs	180	MBF	\$ 255.00	\$45,900.00	\$ 200.00	\$36,000.00	\$ 165.00	\$29,700.00	\$ 285.00	\$51,300.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	1	MBF	\$ 170.00	\$170.00	\$ 160.00	\$160.00	\$ 200.00	\$200.00	\$ 300.00	\$300.00
Totals	517	CDS	Total	\$55,183.50	Total	\$52,960.87	Total	\$39,739.00	Total	\$62,305.00
	181	MBF			10%=	\$5,296.09	10%=	\$3,973.90	10%=	\$6,230.50

			MINIMUM BID		Minerick		Franks		Northwest Hdws	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Oak Pulp	400	CDS	\$ 15.30	\$6,120.00	\$ 12.00	\$4,800.00	\$ 28.55	\$11,420.00	\$ 15.00	\$6,000.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	55	CDS	\$ 21.30	\$1,171.50	\$ 12.00	\$660.00	\$ 26.25	\$1,443.75	\$ 15.00	\$825.00
Aspen Pulp	60	CDS	\$ 29.80	\$1,788.00	\$ 15.00	\$900.00	\$ 30.00	\$1,800.00	\$ 5.00	\$300.00
Fir/Spruce Pulp	2	CDS	\$ 17.00	\$34.00	\$ 10.00	\$20.00	\$ 15.00	\$30.00	\$ 1.00	\$2.00
Oak Logs	180	MBF	\$ 255.00	\$45,900.00	\$ 155.00	\$27,900.00	\$ 180.00	\$32,400.00	\$ 300.00	\$54,000.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	1	MBF	\$ 170.00	\$170.00	\$ 155.00	\$155.00	\$ 150.00	\$150.00	\$ 150.00	\$150.00
Totals	517	CDS	Total	\$55,183.50	Total	\$34,435.00	Total	\$47,243.75	Total	\$61,277.00
	181	MBF			10%=	\$3,443.50	10%=	\$4,724.38	10%=	\$6,127.70

Fall 2023 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

* Shaded Area Indicates High Bidder

Chernobyl

Scale Sale

Advertised # 5

Attendees:

Size: 69 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 10/10/2023
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

			MINIMUM BID		Wild Rivers Forestry		Briarton Logging		Pyrzcz	
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	700	CDS	\$ 21.00	\$14,700.00	\$ 31.31	\$21,917.00	\$ 14.00	\$9,800.00	\$ 31.00	\$21,700.00
Basswood Pulp	190	CDS	\$ 6.80	\$1,292.00	\$ 5.11	\$970.90	\$ 14.00	\$2,660.00	\$ 20.00	\$3,800.00
Fir/Spruce Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 17.00	\$340.00	\$ 12.11	\$242.20	\$ 14.00	\$280.00	\$ 10.00	\$200.00
Aspen Pulp	6	CDS	\$ 29.80	\$178.80	\$ 28.11	\$168.66	\$ 14.00	\$84.00	\$ 26.00	\$156.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	35	MBF	\$ 170.00	\$5,950.00	\$ 180.00	\$6,300.00	\$ 150.00	\$5,250.00	\$ 125.00	\$4,375.00
Basswood Logs	90	MBF	\$ 153.00	\$13,770.00	\$ 85.00	\$7,650.00	\$ 100.00	\$9,000.00	\$ 100.00	\$9,000.00
Sugar Maple Logs	40	MBF	\$ 255.00	\$10,200.00	\$ 260.00	\$10,400.00	\$ 250.00	\$10,000.00	\$ 200.00	\$8,000.00
Totals	916	CDS	Total	\$46,430.80	Total	\$47,648.76	Total	\$37,074.00	Total	\$47,231.00
	165	MBF			10%=	\$4,764.88	10%=	\$3,707.40	10%=	\$4,723.10

			MINIMUM BID		Shamco		Franks			
Products	Volume		Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	700	CDS	\$ 21.00	\$14,700.00	\$ 18.70	\$13,090.00	\$ 28.15	\$19,705.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Basswood Pulp	190	CDS	\$ 6.80	\$1,292.00	\$ 18.70	\$3,553.00	\$ 6.00	\$1,140.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Fir/Spruce Pulp	20	CDS	\$ 17.00	\$340.00	\$ 15.00	\$300.00	\$ 12.00	\$240.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	6	CDS	\$ 29.80	\$178.80	\$ 30.00	\$180.00	\$ 20.00	\$120.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	35	MBF	\$ 170.00	\$5,950.00	\$ 180.00	\$6,300.00	\$ 170.00	\$5,950.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Basswood Logs	90	MBF	\$ 153.00	\$13,770.00	\$ 115.00	\$10,350.00	\$ 145.00	\$13,050.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Sugar Maple Logs	40	MBF	\$ 255.00	\$10,200.00	\$ 275.00	\$11,000.00	\$ 345.00	\$13,800.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	916	CDS	Total	\$46,430.80	Total	\$44,773.00	Total	\$54,005.00	Total	\$0.00
	165	MBF			10%=	\$4,477.30	10%=	\$5,400.50	10%=	\$0.00

Fall 2023 Timber Sale Bid Summary for Florence County Forest

NO BID

Quartz Creek

Scale Sale

Advertised # 6

Attendees:

Size: 76 acres
Contract Length: 3 year

Time & Date of Opening: 9:00AM 10/10/2023
Location: Florence Resource Center
5617 Forestry Drive
Florence, WI 54121

Mary Podnar
Tyler Wood
Taylor Ziolkowski
Pat Smith

Products	Volume		MINIMUM BID							
			Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	450	CDS	\$ 12.80	\$5,760.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	300	CDS	\$ 10.20	\$3,060.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	270	CDS	\$ 17.90	\$4,833.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	10	CDS	\$ 7.70	\$77.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	35	MBF	\$ 102.00	\$3,570.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Basswood Logs	3	MBF	\$ 92.00	\$276.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	1030	CDS	Total	\$17,576.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	38	MBF			10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00

Products	Volume		MINIMUM BID							
			Bid	Value	Bid	Value		Value		Value
Mixed Hardwood Pulp	450	CDS	\$ 12.80	\$5,760.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Conifer Pulp	300	CDS	\$ 10.20	\$3,060.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Aspen Pulp	270	CDS	\$ 17.90	\$4,833.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	10	CDS	\$ 7.70	\$77.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Mixed Hardwood Logs	35	MBF	\$ 102.00	\$3,570.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Basswood Logs	3	MBF	\$ 92.00	\$276.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00	\$ -	\$0.00
Totals	1030	CDS	Total	\$17,576.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00	Total	\$0.00
	38	MBF			10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00	10%=	\$0.00

2023 FALL TIMBER SALES - FLORENCE COUNTY

Sale #	Sale Name	Contractor	Minimum Bid	High Bid
1	Optimus Pine	Bell Timber	\$ 64,994.00	\$ 127,652.50
2	Shin Dig Aspen	No Bid	\$ 27,566.00	
3	Big Block	Wild Rivers Forestry	\$ 24,820.00	\$ 27,610.70
4	Red Tide	Albrecht Trucking II	\$ 55,183.50	\$ 62,305.00
5	Chernobyl	Franks Logging	\$ 46,430.80	\$ 54,005.00
6	Quartz Creek	No Bid	\$ 17,576.00	
	Total		\$ 236,570.30	\$ 271,573.20
			Spring Sold Value	\$ 157,610.05
			Total for 2023	\$ 429,183.25